
- LAllpANCE V. OOODRICH

^SENIOR ATTORNEY

RECORDATION NO.

3

CRAVATH, SWAINE & MOORE

ONE CHASED MANHATTAN PLAZA

., YORK, N- Y- 10005Filed & Recorded

TELEPHONE

212 422-3OOO

TELEX
RCA 233663

WUD 125547

WUI O2O976

TRT 177149

oo
MOT COMMERCE COMMISSION

— " s£ * *-* ™t H v .S
'

CRAVATH, N. Y.

CRAVATH, LONDON E. C. 2

UJ**-
f s. ^JP_!

o,.
o^

TV*r

IU
,O-

3 1987

$0;£0mt

'• .^ton, D. Cn

L r̂v^o

Z HONEY LANE, CHEAPSIDE

LONDON EC2V 6BT, ENGLAND

TELEPHONE: I-6O6-I42I

TELEX: 86I49OI

R API FAX/I NFOTEC:

I-6O6-I425

March 2, 1987

Amendment Agreement No. 1 Dated as of February 1. 1987
Amending Conditional Sale Agreement Filed under

Recordation No. 15048
Lease of Railroad Equipment Filed under

Recordation No. 15048-B

Dear Ms. McGee:,

Pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303 and the Commission's
rules and regulations thereunder, as amended, I enclose
herewith on behalf of Chicago and North Wesftern Transporta-
tion Company for filing and recordation counterparts of the
following:

Amendment Agreement No. 1 dated as of February 1,
1987, among Chicago and North Western Transportation
Company, as Lessee, Mercantile-Safe Deposit and Trust
Company, as Agent, United States Trust Company of New
York, as Trustee, General Electric Credit Corporation,
as Owner, and the parties named in Schedule B to the
Participation Agreement, as Investors.

The Amendment Agreement amends the Conditional
Sale Agreement and the Lease of Railroad Equipment each
dated as of August 1, 1986, previously filed and recorded
with the Interstate Commerce Commission on September 9,
1986, at 3:15 p.m., Recordation No. 15048.



The Amendment Agreement amends the Conditional
Sale Agreement and the Lease of Railroad Equipment to
reflect the road numbers of the units of Equipment actually
delivered and accepted thereunder and to adjust the Amor-
tization Schedule and the Basic Rental and Casualty and
Termination Value percentages.

The Amendment Agreement contains the signatures of
each party to the Conditional Sale Agreement and the Lease
and each of those signatures are notarized. The Amendment
Agreement also contains signatures of other parties for the
purpose of amending a related Participation Agreement which
is not a document on file with the Commission and, accor-
dingly, such signatures are not, and are not required to be,
notarized.

Please file and record the Amendment Agreement
submitted with this letter and assign it Recordation Num-
ber 15048-D.

Enclosed is a check for $10 payable to the Inter-
state Commerce Commission for the recordation fee for the
Amendment Agreement.

Please stamp all counterparts of the enclosed
document with your official recording stamp. You will wish
to retain one copy of the document and this transmittal
letter for your files. It is requested that the remaining
counterparts of the document be delivered to the bearer of
this letter.

Very truly yours,

Laurance V. Goodrich
as Agent for
Chicago and North Western
Transportation Company

Ms. Noreta R. McGee, Secretary,
Interstate Commerce Commission,

Washington, D.C. 20423.

Encls.



OFFICE OF TUB SECRETARY

Cmmncrtt
B.C. 20423

<• March 3, 1987

Cravath, swatne % Moore
One Ghase Manhattan Plaza
New York, New York 10005

Dear

The enclosed document's) was recorded pursuant to the provi-

sions of Section 11303 of the Interstate Commerce Act, 49 U". S.C,

11303, on 3-3-87 at 12:40PM , and assigned re-

recordation number<3) j5048-D,15049-l) and 15050-D

Sincerely yours.

-G*<*4j£i+\

Enclosure (s)

SE-30
(7/79)



ppr?

[ P 6 2 2 4 4 A ]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

rdfid

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
(''Agent") , UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as. defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also.now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "21.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by.
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but

solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U^S.),

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by ;
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

fOn this frH daj£ of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ~77/?. J/AJ&jLgf̂ f̂  , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY , that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the

instrument was the free act and
-(Iê F̂ î p|̂ ôrpoYation.

Lisa M. Fanelli

MJ Co
'iW11

mission Expires Feb. 19, 1990

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

. /°ff

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss.:

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased

Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installjment
Number and Date

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)1
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)1
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99) 1
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00) 1
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)1

Total

Debt
Service

489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20.

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000.000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

In I 5 5|
W EH S Q

Q -P Ul W
-P ^ «J - Q -y Q -d

ID
•<*
CM

ffl
O ' Q v o f f i ^ ' p f i X - H
• H - p o o y i P H H M H
j u y c n Q j C i d . Q j S ' H( X O H t - ^ l X ^ S D - i H

in
p»CM

o
oo
cT
OJin

oo
o

•l.

in
en

•w-

in
CM

O
O
o

«k
o
fM
ro

CQ

•H '0 0)tn 4J ffl >

in

C O C O CO

CM 00 ^J1

r> ro •<*
o o o
CO CO 00

A-
r»
r̂

18 .

2 S l ^ § l § m«-i id g „ -.H w fe g•H vo S Q) (H
4 J C O T J J 5 -i-lfl-H<0 m Tj i£> Q.I3 o
O • 4-S ft oo ft ffl _

•H O JO /a CT> p >^ AcH
<H 55 73 S H B Jj <5?-P

^s•gs

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price**

107.
105.
106.
104.
104.
102.
102.
99.
99.
96.
95.
92.
91.
86.
81.
80.
74.
73,
67,
66,
58,
58,
49,
49,
40,
40,
30,
30.
20,
20,

057
636
217
346
703
362
478
624
559
364
672
810
747
911
452
406
569
458
221
037
087
053
536
505
298
365
359
568
015
000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium,
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of-August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance- of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title: CORPORATE TRUST OFFICER

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY-r-^as Argent,

Title:
PRESIDENT

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by ;
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

/

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by.
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.)f

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by_
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by __
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
Of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE , )

On this f day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared R. E. Schreiber f to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a VICE PRES,OENT

 of MERCANTILE -SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

1—" Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires /̂'"



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada _
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased
Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67,259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date.

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)1
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)1
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)1
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)1
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)1

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21
,163,318.21
235,893.74
,008,806.31
196,475.20
,332,713.95
138,527.02
,458,391.27
71,213.95

,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
O.CO

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
' 0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0,00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000,000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

o
o
o

N,
inf»CM

o
o
o

oo
o

•k

in
<Ti
CM

H"

oo
o
in"
CJ

oo
o
d"
CN

vi-

vo H inn ^r Tt
060
op co co
CN 00 •*
ro en ^«
o o o
00 00 CO

CQ

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 . 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



GtST

[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Eguipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

.
Title ASSISTANT SECRETARY

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by
iSISTANT VICE PRESIDENT

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:.

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

Title:
JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by_
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.),

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by ;
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) SS. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) SS. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a Of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) SS. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK, )

On this yv day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared LOUIS P. YOUNG
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a ASSISTANT VICE PRESIDENT of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said,.
corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

FEDERICO C. SANTOS
Notary Public, State of New York

No. 41-4691650
Qualified in Queens County

Commission Expires March 30, 19!

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before roe
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased
Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest Principal
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

' 0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

o.oo.
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000.000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

o
o
o
in"r»
CO

o
o
o
o"
in

*.
«*

J
o
oo

•k.

in<y\
CM

in
CM

O
O
O

d"
CO

H
in-

vo H in
o o o
CO CO CO

co co ^r
f) CO ^*
o o o
CO CO CO

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446 .
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/9.2 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M. Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"53.349193%" and to substitute the figure //72.83299%//

therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by.
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT. CORPORA-
TION,

Title: RAYMOND' W. LEYDEN.^R. JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ATTESTING SECRETARY ANCE COMPANY,

by_
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by.
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.),

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by
Title:

by_
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by :
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss.:

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this. ]6K_ day of February 1987, before me
personally appearedT̂ ckJ c_X. O^ r'HLJÛ L-K-—- >
to me personally .-known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a ifn<j//TYu I-TComtfA^ of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, tfiat the seal^affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporatior

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notaryy Public
JO-ANN ROMAN
NOTARY PUB i. • ~

My COMMISSION EXPIP-- ,991

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased

Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94).
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)1
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)1
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)1
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00) 1
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01) 1

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21
,163,318.21
235,893.74
,008,806.31
196,475.20
,332,713.95
138,527.02
,458,391.27
71,213.95

,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10,000,000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

SlS2
*i in̂r

CM

O
O
O

*,
in

oMin
H

*i O
O
o
in*(nCM

•h.

H

in
(N

O
O
O

vo 1-1 in
SSS
CO COCO

CM CO •<*
n r> «*
o o o
00 CO CO

£|•i~

(C

6

M

04

-" i
W

H ci) tn
ra rH (o »

•5 f8 E <U S
fe 5 ,5 •£ m•H CO JO Q)
^ -H a a ' .
5 O C -P ̂  <J3

>i ft-H § «i-i <y>
fl C/V4J g O H

ffl

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3,
5,
3,

3,
5,
3,

56549
83693
60624

5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
,69085
,86056
,95071

7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price**

107.
105.
106.
104.
104.
102.
102.
99.
99.
96.
95.
92.
91.
86.
81.
80.
74.
73.
67.
66,
58,
58,
49,
49,
40,
40,
3.0,
30.
20,
20,

057
636
217
346
703
362
478
624
559
364
672
810
747
911
452
406
569
458
221
037
087
053
536
505
298
365
359
568
015
000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "12.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN
ANC

1ENT OM-ICERSEN 10!

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN ̂ xPUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by_
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.)/

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by.
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss.:

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
Of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a Of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada -
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased

Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
d/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
. 196,475.20
1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000.000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

o , -y w _ . .. w
* % 9 81oU J5 .. m -H
O O v o f f l ^ T J C i ^

•H 4J CO
JM 5 <y>
ft O H

-»*

Iin O
^in

CN

ooo
hk

oooin

I.•a a in

o
o
o
in"

O (0
-P CO

vo H in
o o o
CO CO CO

CM CO M1

CO CO ^*o o o
CO CO CO

o
•H
-P
-H

1

H
H

u

i
fm

? <
I<w

•H

«

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium,
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-

. sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordatiori numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

\
TSVEMS, AS3T. D\R,

VESTMENTS

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.),

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by_
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
\

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a Of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance. Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C £2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased

Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321, 137 .-37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000.000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396., 351. 93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

<H
O

-P
•-)

*8
l '&

in**
CM

ooo
*.

in
r»
CM

O
(Nin

8
inenCM

ooo
in*

o
o
o

^o
CM

CQ

X
0)
iH

O (0
4-> W

•H Q Q)
W JJ 05 >
- (0 '>—-H
0> O W

vo tn
o o o
CO COCO

CM oo ^rM rv-sro o o
CO CO CO

o
•H
-P
•H

1

in

"fca
•H Ws

-w ,
^"H
S'g

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 - 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Eguipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "21.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of, the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

Title: Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
* Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by_
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.),

L BROCK THOMSON bv
TREASURER

JOHN N. WHELIHAN
ASSISTANT ViCE PRESIDENT by_^

for PRESIDENT

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA, /•

ROY P. CREEDON by
SENIOR ASSOCIATE COUNSEL Tltle:

lor SECRETARY
THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY ,

Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a Of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a Of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1).
Increased
Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation Schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475,20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10,000,000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

S-A



Transaction A

(D
-P

o
o
o

•k.

in
**CM

s•w-

o
ta,

in
CM

o
o
o
cT
CMin

•w-

i
o
oô
in

O§
*,

in

O
O
O

o"
(N
CO

vo H in
n >* •sj'
o o o
00 00 00

CM 00 ^
n co ^r
o o o
00 00 00

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 , 92.810
7/2/93 ' 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 - 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1,.1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "12.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, E and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but

solely as Trustee,

by ..
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by ;
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by_
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.)/

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_ .
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by_ a
mi fr«j ,. . //
Tltle* 2nd

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY ,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss.:

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss. :

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased
Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

. Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
(1/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

Total

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30

. 478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10,000,000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

5•H i-H Q)
E-i S Q

in*t
CM

oo
o

•h

If)1̂
CN

ooo
cT
LO

•k.

<*
H
•W-

H

O
Oo
in"a\CM

».
H
to-

If)
CN

O
O
O

cT
CM

Sfii

CQ

5

VO H If)
O ••* **
O O O
CO CO CO

CM CO ^J-
n r> ^f
o o o
CO CO CO

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023.
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium,
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A



[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK . ("Trustee") , GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the ."Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
//59.349193%// and to substitute the figure "12.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but
solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by.
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.)/

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title: Senior Vice President

and Treasurer

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Title:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss.:

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a Of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss.:

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

Notary Public

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.) .

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased
Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

and Date

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
d/2/97)
(7/2/97)
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99)
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00)
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)

lotal

Debt
Service

$

*
489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74'
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000,000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50

• 4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

Oo
O

*,

in
o
Min

!
^£

O
O
O

•».

in
<Ti
CM

r-T
i/V

oo
o

Mk

inCM o
<M

vo H inr» ^r ^
o o o
CO CO 00

CM co r̂r) r> ̂ t
o o o
CO CO CO

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3.56549
5.83693
3.60624
5.94518
3.48695
6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8'. 31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 . 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid,-the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A





[P62244A]
[CS&M Ref. 2046-262A]

AMENDMENT AGREEMENT NO. 1, dated as of
February 1, 1987, among CHICAGO AND NORTH
WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY ("Lessee"),
MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND TRUST COMPANY
("Agent"), UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF NEW
YORK ("Trustee"), GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION ("Owner"), and THE PARTIES NAMED
IN SCHEDULE B to the Participation Agreement
described below (together with their succes-
sors and assigns, "Investors").

WHEREAS each of the parties hereto has entered
into a Participation Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986,
("Participation Agreement");

WHEREAS the Builder (as defined in the Participa-
tion Agreement) and the Trustee have entered into a Condi-
tional Sale Agreement dated as of August 1, 1986 (the
"CSA"), and since the Builder has been paid in full under
the CSA and all the Builder's other rights have been
assigned to the Agent, the Builder is no longer a party in
interest to this transaction;

WHEREAS the Lessee and the Trustee have entered
into a Lease of Railroad Equipment dated as of August 1,
1986 (the "Lease");

WHEREAS the CSA and the Lease were filed with the
Interstate Commerce Commission pursuant to 49 U.S.C. § 11303
on September 9, 1986, at 3:15 p.m., recordation numbers
15048 and 15048-B, respectively, and deposited in the Office
of the Registrar General of Canada pursuant to Section 86 of
the Railway Act of Canada on September 9, 1986, at 2:50 p.m.;

WHEREAS pursuant to Paragraph 19 of the Participa-
tion Agreement the parties hereto have acknowledged the need
to amend the Participation Agreement, the CSA and the Lease
as a result of a Change in Tax Law (as defined in said Para-
graph 19) ;

WHEREAS the parties hereto also now desire to
amend certain provisions of the Documents (as defined in the
Participation Agreement) to increase the commitment of each
Investor to fund a portion of the Purchase Price of the
Equipment;



NOW, THEREFORE, the parties hereto hereby agree as
follows:

1. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein
shall have the respective meanings set forth in the Partici-
pation Agreement.

2. Each Investor's commitment to fund a portion
of the Purchase Price of the Equipment by investing in the
CSA Indebtedness shall be increased from 59.349193% to
72.83299% of such Purchase Price, and the Owner will finance
the balance of the cost of the Equipment.

3. The third paragraph on page P-l of the Par-
ticipation Agreement is hereby amended to delete the figure
"59.349193%" and to substitute the figure "72.83299%"
therefor and to delete the figure "40.650807%" and to
substitute "27.16701%" therefor. In order to effect such
increased commitment, each Investor will pay to the Agent in
immediately available funds not later than 11:00 a.m.,
Baltimore time, on February 11, 1987, its Increased Commit-
ment as shown in Column 1 of Appendix A hereto, and the
Agent shall transmit an amount equal to the aggregate amount
of the Increased Commitment of each Investor to the Owner on
such date. Upon payment to the Agent of the Increased
Commitment, the Agent will execute and deliver to each
Investor a certificate or certificates of interest with
respect to its payment bearing interest at the rate of 10.2%
per annum substantially in the form annexed as Exhibit C to
the Participation Agreement containing the appropriate
information and dated February 11, 1987.

On February 11, 1987, the Lessee will pay to the
Agent and the Agent shall immediately pay to each Investor
an amount equal to interest at the rate of 3.934772% per
annum on the amount shown after such Investor's name in
Column 2 on Appendix A hereto from December 29, 1986, to,
but not including, February 11, 1987. On February 11, 1987,
the Lessee will pay to the Agent and the Agent shall imme-
diately pay to the Owner $105,897.53 representing interest
on the Owner's Excess Investment.

4. Subparagraph (a) of the third paragraph of
Article 4 of the CSA is hereby amended by deleting

2-A



"40.650807%" appearing therein and substituting "27.16701%"
therefor.

5. Schedule I and Annex B to the CSA are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedule I and Annex B
hereto, respectively.

6. Schedules A, B and C to the Lease are hereby
amended to read as set forth in Schedules A, B and C hereto.

7. The Documents are each hereby amended so that
any reference to any Document contained in any Document is
hereby deemed to refer to such Document as amended hereby.

8. Except as amended hereby, the Documents shall
remain unaltered and in full force and effect.

9. The Trustee will promptly cause this Amendment
Agreement to be filed with the Interstate Commerce Commis-
sion in accordance with the provisions of Article 18 of the
CSA, and Section 15 of the Lease.

10. This Amendment Agreement may be executed in
any number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to
be an original and all of which together shall constitute a
single instrument. It shall not be necessary that any
counterpart be signed by all parties so long as each party
shall deliver a counterpart signed by it to Cravath, Swaine
& Moore, special counsel for the Agent.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused
this Amendment Agreement to be executed and duly authorized
officers or other persons,, as of the date first above
written.

CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN
TRANSPORTATION COMPANY,

by_
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

3-A



[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT AND
TRUST COMPANY, as Agent,

by
Title:

Title:

[Seal]

Attest:

Title:

UNITED STATES TRUST COMPANY OF
NEW YORK, not individually but

solely as Trustee,

by
Title:

[Corporate Seal]

Attest:

Title:

GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT CORPORA-
TION,

by
Title:

JOHN HANCOCK MUTUAL LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

STATE TREASURER OF THE STATE OF
MICHIGAN CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC
SCHOOL EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM: STATE EMPLOYEES RETIRE-
MENT SYSTEM: STATE POLICE
PENSION, ACCIDENT AND DISABILITY
FUND: JUDGES RETIREMENT SYSTEM:
AND PROBATE JUDGES RETIREMENT
SYSTEM,

by
Title:

4-A



SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA (U.S.),

by
Title:

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE COMPANY OF
CANADA,

by_
Title:

by
Title:

THE MUTUAL BENEFIT LIFE INSUR-
ANCE COMPANY,

by
Title:

WOODMEN ACCIDENT AND LIFE
COMPANY,

by
Title:

FIRST COLONY LIFE INSURANCE
COMPANY,

by
Trjzle:



STATE OF ILLINOIS,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF COOK, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me person-
ally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he is
of CHICAGO AND NORTH WESTERN TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, that
the seal affixed to the foregoing instrument is the corpo-
rate seal of said Corporation, and that said instrument was
signed and sealed on behalf of said Corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and he acknowledged that the
execution of the foregoing instrument was the free act and
deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF MARYLAND, )
) ss.:

COUNTY OF BALTIMORE,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared , to me
personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says that he
is a of MERCANTILE-SAFE DEPOSIT
AND TRUST COMPANY, that one of the seals affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires



STATE OF NEW YORK,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF NEW YORK,)

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of UNITED STATES
TRUST COMPANY OF NEW YORK, that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the corporate seal of said corpora-
tion, and that said instrument was signed and sealed on
behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of
Directors, and he acknowledged that the execution of the
foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said
corporation.

Notary Public

[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

STATE OF CONNECTICUT,)
) ss. :

COUNTY OF FAIRFIELD, )

On this day of February 1987, before me
personally appeared ,
to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, says
that he is a of GENERAL ELECTRIC CREDIT
CORPORATION, that the seal affixed to the foregoing instru-
ment is the corporate seal of said Corporation, and that
said instrument was signed and sealed on behalf of said
Corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he
acknowledged that the execution of the foregoing instrument
was the free act and deed of said corporation.

Notary Public
[Notarial Seal]

My Commission expires

7-A



APPENDIX A

Investor

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #1

John Hancock Mutual
Life Insurance Com-
pany A/C #2

State Treasurer of
the State of
Michigan

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
(U.S.)

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 1/3

Sun Life Assurance
Company of Canada
A/C 2/3

The Mutual Benefit
Life Insurance Com-
pany

Woodmen Accident &
Life Insurance Com-
pany

First Colony Life
Insurance Company

Transaction A

(1)
Increased

Commitment

807,113.73

89,679.30

428,667.07

134,518.96

44,839.65

89,679.30

224,198.26

67,259.48

67.259.48

1,953,215.23

(2)
Interest

Multiplicand

47,473.30

5,274.81

25,213.60

7,912.22

2,637.41

5,274.81

13,187.03

3,956.11

3.956.11

$114,885.40

8-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE I

Allocation schedule of each $10,000,000
of 10.2% CSA Indebtedness

Installment
Number and Date

(Interim
Payment)

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

(1/2/87)
(7/2/87)
(1/2/88)
(7/2/88)
(1/2/89)
(7/2/89)
(1/2/90)
(7/2/90)
(1/2/91)
(7/2/91)
(1/2/92)
(7/2/92)
(1/2/93)
(7/2/93)
(1/2/94)
(7/2/94)
(1/2/95)
(7/2/95)
(1/2/96)
(7/2/96)
d/2/97)
(7/2/97)1
(1/2/98)
(7/2/98)1
(1/2/99)
(7/2/99) 1
(1/2/00)
(7/2/00) 1
(1/2/01)
(7/2/01)1

Total

Debt
Service

Interest
Payment

$

*
489,542.79
510,000.00
495,137.93
495,137.93
478,759.92
478,759.92
460,711.36
460,711.36
440,821.84
440,821.84
418,903.59
418,903.59
402,965.54
402,965.54
375,735.74
346,206.31
346,206.31
314,645.33
314,645.33
280,897.21
280,897.21
235,893.74
235,893.74
196,475.20
196,475.20
138,527.02
138,527.02
71,213.95
71,213.95

Principal
Recovery

$

0.00
0.00

291,413.22
0.00

321,137.37
0.00

353,893.38
0.00

389,990.51
0.00

429,769.54
0.00

312,510.95
0.00

533,917.65
579,008.44

0.00
618,842.57

0.00
661,727.87

0.00
882,421.00

0.00
772,912.57

0.00
1,136,238.75

0.00
1,319,864.25

0.00
1,396,351.93

10.000.000.00

Ending
Principal
Balance

$

10,000,000.00
10,000,000.00
9,708,586.78
9,708,586.78
9,387,449.41
9,387,449.41
9,033,556.03
9,033,556.03
8,643,565.52
8,643,565.52
8,213,795.98
8,213,795.98
7,901,285.03
7,901,285.03
7,367,367.38
6,788,358.94
6,788,358.94
6,169,516.37
6,169,516.37
5,507,788.50
5,507,788.50
4,625,367.50
4,625,367.50
3,852,454.93
3,852,454.93
2,716,216.18
2,716,216.18
1,396,351.93
1,396,351.93

0.00

489,542.79
801,413.22
495,137.93
816,275.30
478,759.92
832,653.30
460,711.36
850,701.87
440,821.84
870,591.38
418,903.59
731,414.54
402,965.54
936,883.19
954,744.18
346,206.31
965,048.88
314,645.33
976,373.20
280,897.21

1,163,318.21
235,893.74

1,008,806.31
196,475.20

1,332,713.95
138,527.02

1,458,391.27
71,213.95

1,467,565.88

* Interest only on the CSA Indebtedness shall be payable to the
extent accrued and unpaid on this date.

9-A



Transaction A

-p

Vj 3

*!
ooo

^in
•*
fM
*»*

rH
•0V

inr^
'CN

O
(N
If)

a•en-
H

*8
If)
cn
CM

O
O
O

o
CM

CQ

X
O <C-P en

VO H If)
n '* "31

o o o
CO CO 00

OJ CO ^
n cn ^t-
o o o
CO CO 00

o
•H

w

i
•H

£
o<

-w I
titi
T3 "H

«

4J

. 8 8
e-HJ.^

10-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE A

Specifications of the Equipment

Lessee's
Identification
Numbers (Both

Type Quantity Inclusive)

Part A: CNW
SD-60 3,800 h.p.
diesel electric 8032-8036
locomotives 8038-8041

8044-8045
Part B:
Additional
Equipment
to be
supplied by
Lessee

11-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE B

Rental Payment Schedule

Date

7/2/87
1/2/88
7/2/88
1/2/89
7/2/89
1/2/90
7/2/90
1/2/91
7/2/91
1/2/92
7/2/92
1/2/93
7/2/93
1/2/94
7/2/94
1/2/95
7/2/95
1/2/96
7/2/96
1/2/97
7/2/97
1/2/98
7/2/98
1/2/99
7/2/99
1/2/00
7/2/00
1/2/01
7/2/01
1/2/02

Percentage of
Purchase Price*

3,
5,
3,

3.56549
5.83693
,60624
.94518
,48695

6.06446
3.35550
6.19592
3.21064
6.34078
3.69085
5.86056
3.95071
7.72324
8.15213
3.52182
8.31578
3.35817
8.48721
3.18675
9.95587
1.71808
10.24296
1.43099
10.66502
1.00893
11.15528
0.51867
11.37023
0.30372

*As defined in Article 4 of the CSA,

12-A



Transaction A

SCHEDULE C

Casualty and Termination Value* Percentage Schedule

Percentage of
Date Purchase Price**

i

7/2/87 107.057
1/2/88 105.636
7/2/88 106.217
1/2/89 104.346
7/2/89 104.703
1/2/90 102.362
7/2/90 102.478
1/2/91 99.624
7/2/91 99.559
1/2/92 96.364
7/2/92 95.672
1/2/93 92.810
7/2/93 91.747
1/2/94 86.911
7/2/94 81.452
1/2/95 80.406
7/2/95 74.569
1/2/96 73.458
7/2/96 67.221
1/2/97 66.037
7/2/97 58.087
1/2/98 58.053
7/2/98 49.536
1/2/99 49.505
7/2/99 40.298
1/2/00 40.365
7/2/00 30.359
1/2/01 30.568
7/2/01 20.015
1/2/02 20.000

*These Termination Value percentages assume that the
CSA Indebtedness may be prepaid at par without premium.
If any premium is to be paid, the amount thereof must
be added to the Termination Values derived from the
listed percentages.

**As defined in Article 4 of the CSA.

13-A


