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September 15, 2009 

Anne K. Quinlan, Esq. 
Acting Secretary 
Surface Transportation Boarci 
395 "E" Street, S.W 
Washington, D.C. 20423-0001 

Dear Ms. Quinlan. 

Enclosed for recordation pursuant to the provisions of 49 U.S.C. Section 
11301 (a) are two (2) copies of a Partial Lease Tennination, dated as of September 
14, 2009, a secondary document as defined In the Board's Rules for the 
Recordation of Documents 

The enclosed document relates to the Lease Agreement and related 
documents previously filed with the Commission under Recordation Number 
17039. 

The names and addresses of the parties to the enclosed document are-

Lessee: Union Pacific Railroad Company 
1416 Dodge Street 
Omaha, NE 68179 

Lessor: U S. Bank National Association, 
(as successor to Meridian Trust Company) 
225 Franklin Street 
Boston, MA 02101 



Anne K. Quinlan, Esq. 
September 15, 2009 
Page 2 

is: 
A description of the railroad equipment covered by the enclosed document 

23 railcars within the series CHTT 500206 - CHTT 500678: 

A short summary of the document to appear in the index follows: 

Partial Lease Termination. 

Also enclosed Is a check In the amount of $41.00 payable.to the order 
of the Surface Transportation Board covering the required recordation fee. 

Kindly return stamped copies of the enclosed document to the undersigned. 

Very truly yours. 

-̂̂ ^̂•i*. 

Robert W. Alvord 

RWA/sem 
Enclosures 



SEP 1 5 '09 - 2 1 5 PM EXECUTION V E R S I O N 

(UPRR 1990-1) 

PARTIAL LEASE TERMINATION 

Dated as of September 14,2009 

behvccn 

UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY, 
as Lessee 

I 

I 

and 

U.S. BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION 
(successor to Meridian Trust Company), 

not in its individual capacity but solely as Owner Trustee, 
as Lessor 

THIS AGREEMENT SHALL BE FILED WITH THE SURFACE TRANSPORTATION 
BOARD AND DEPOSITED IN THE OFFICE OF THE REGISTRAR GENERAL OF 
CANADA, AND UPON SUCH FILING, EACH OF THE DOCUMENTS DESCRIBED ON 
EXHIBIT B ATTACHED HERETO, AND THE INTERESTS OF TIIE PARTIES 
EVIDENCED THEREBY, SHALL BE TERMINATED OR RELEASED, AS THE CASE MAY 
BE, WITH RESPECT TO THE EQUIPMENT, AND ONLY THE EQUIPMENT, DESCRIBED 
ON EXHIBIT A ATTACHED HERETO. 



THIS PARTIAL LEASE TERMINATION (this "Agi-eement"), dated as of September 
14, 2009 between UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY, a Delaware coipoiation (the 
"Lessee"), and U.S. BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION (successor to Meridian Tiust 
Company), a national banking association, not in its individual capacity except as otherwise 
exprcs.sly piovided, but solely as the Ownei Tiuslee (the "Owner Trustee" or "Lessor") undei the 
Trust Agreement, 

W I T N E S S E T H 

WHEREAS, the Lessee and the Owner Trustee have hcietofore entered into a Lease 
Agreement dated as of September 1, 1990 (as supplemented and amended from time-to-time, the 
"Lease"; capitalized terais used herein without definition shall have the lespective meanings set 
forth in the Lease); 

WHEREAS, Section 4(b) of the Lease provides for the redelivery at the end of the Basic 
Tei m of the Hopper Cars; and 

WHEREAS, the Lessee pravided notice to Lessor dated Decembei 16, 2008, that it has 
elected to ictum the Hopper Cais at the end of the Basic Tcim; 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises and foi good and sufficient 
consideiation, the parties heieto heicby agiec as follows* 

1 The Lessor and the Lessee hereby acknowledge that effective as of the date 
heieof, the Lease is hereby tenninated and canceled in accordance with its tcnns with lespect to . 
the Hopper Cais refcienced in Exliiblt A attached hereto (the 'Terminated Cais"); piovided that 
nothing contained herein shall affect those piovisions of the Lease or the Participation 
Agicement which are expressly stated to suivive such teimination. 

2. The Lessor will give the Lessee no less than two (2) days pnor notice of the 
closing date foi the sale of the Tcnninated Cais (the "Delivery Date"), 'ilie Lessee heicby agrees 
that no latei than seven (7) days after the Delivery Date, the Lessee will deliver the Terminated 
Cais to the Lessee's Interchange Point with Burlington Northern Santa Fe Railroad m 
Minneapolis, Minnesota (the "Tiansfer Location") and that the Lessee will be responsible for all i 
costs associated with such move (including any stotage costs) and any applicable taxes prioi to 
tender of the Teiminated Cars for delivery at the Tiansfer Location The Lessee will give the 
Lessoi no less than two (2) days prior notice of the deliveiy date for the Temiinatcd Cais at the 
Transfer Location. 

3. This Agieement may be executed by the parties hereto in sepaiate coiinteiparts, 
each of which when so executed and deliveied shall be an oiiginal, but all such coiinteiparts shall 
togcthei constitute one and the same instiaiment. 

4. This Agieement shall be governed by and constiiied in accoidance with the laws 
ofthe State of New York. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, each of the parties heieto, pursuant to due corporate 
authority, has caused this instrument to be duly executed in its coiporate name by its oificeis 
thereunto duly authorized, all as ofthe date Hist above written. 

UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY, 
as Lessee 

Name: Gaiy W. Giosz 
Title: Assistant Treasurei 

U S. BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION 
(successoi to Meridian Trust Company), 
not in its individual capacity but solely as Owner 
Tiustce, 
as Lessor 

B y : _ 
Name: 
Title: 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, each of the parties hereto, pursuant to due corporate 
authority, has caused this instrument to be duly executed in its corporate name by its ofGcers 
thereunto duly authorized, all as ofthe date fii-st above written. 

UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY, 
as Lessee 

By: 
Name: Gary W. Grosz 
Title: Assistant Treasurer 

U.S. BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIAHON 
(successor to Meridian Trust Company), 
not in its individual capacity but solely as Owner 
Trustee, 
as Lessor '̂  

Joanne L. Wright 
Trust Officer 

Partial Lease Temiinaticm (UPRR 1990-1) 
Slrala Railcars Purchase Agreement v 31 



State of Nebraska ) 
) ss 

County of Douglas ) 

On this jiyjcy day of J P.i^n9.\n\ b^̂ f?* 2009. befoie me, a notaiy public, personally 
appeared Gaiy \V. Grosz, to me personally known, who being by me duly sworn says that ho is 
the Assistant Treasurer of UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY and that said instrument 
was executed on behalf of said coiporation by autlioiity of its Boaid of Dircctois, and he 
acknowledged that the execution ofthe foregoing instrument was the flee act and deed of said 
coiporation. 

(Notarial Seal) / <^^w- I V ^ , » ^ . , , 

GENERAL NOTARY • Slate of Nebraska 
P A M N E U M A N 

^ > ^ ^ My CBmin. Bp . Dw. 15,2010 

Pam Neiiman, Notary Public 

My Commission Expires: Dec 15.2010 

State of Dclawaie ) 
) ss 

County of New Castle) 

On this day of , 2009, befoie me, a notary public, peisonally 
appeared , to me peisonally known, who being by mc duly swoin 
says that (s)he is the of U.S. BANK, NATIONAL 
ASSOCIATION (SUCCESSOR TO MERIDIAN TRUST COMPANY, N.A.) and that said 
instrument was executed on behalf of .said coiporation by authonty of its Boaid of Directois, and 
(s)he acknowledged that the execution ofthe foiegoing instrument was the fiec act and deed of 
said corporation. 

(Notarial Seal) 
Notaiy Public 

My Commission Expiics 
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State of Nebraska ) 
) ss 

County of Douglas ) 

On this day of , 2009, before me, a notary public, personally 
appeared Gary W. Grosz, to me personally known, who being by me duly sworn says that he is 
the Assistant Treasurer of UNION PACIFIC RAILROAD COMPANY and that said instrument 
was executed on behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and he 
acknowledged that the execution ofthe fijregoing instrument was the free act and deed of said 
corporation. 

(Notarial Seal) 
Pam Neuman, Notary Public 

My Commission Expiies: Dec. 15.2010 

OnjMs InrJy day of J^P(Ell\B^^ . 2009, before me, a notary public, personally 
appeared JQJHAIAJ£ L " biOlG^ .tome personally known, who being by me duly sworn 
says that (s)he is the T/'>Ujr Qpf/Cg^ of U.S. BANK, NATIONAL 
ASSOCLV'nON (SUCCESSOR TO MERIDIAN TRUST COMPANY, N.A.) and that said 
instrument was executed on behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of Diiectors, and 
(s)he acknowledged that the execution ofthe foregoing instrument was the free act and deed of 
said corporation. 

(Notarial Seal) l:JlMmjLu 
Notary Public 

My Commission Expires: fOlSdlSLOl^ 

0 
^ KENNETH E.HOLBERT,SR. 

NOTARY PUBLIC 
State of Oelawara 

Mv Commission Expires: October 30,2012 

I 

State of Delaware ) 
) ss 

County of New Castle) ! 
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Exhibit A j 

EQUIPMENT TO BE RELEASED 

Description: Rotary dump hoppei cars 

Total Quantity of Units to be Released: 23 
I 

Mark: CHTT 

500206 
500219 
500270 
500307 I 
500322 I 
500326 
500329 
500330 
500348 
500385 I 
500396 . i 
500411 
500431 
500483 
500489 
500495 
500498 
500532 
500547 
500571 
500664 
500667 
500678 
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Exhibit B 
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ORIGINAL SURFACE TRANSPORTATION BOARD FILINGS 

Description 

Lease Agieement, dated as of September 1, 1990, 
between Meridian Tiiist Company, as Lessor, and Union 
Pacific Railroad Company, as Lessee 

Indenture and Security Agreement, dated as of 
September 1,1990, between Meridian Trust Company, 
as Owner Trustee, and Wilmington Tnist Company, as 
Indentuie Tiustee 

Lease and Indenture Supplement No. 1, dated Octobei 1, 
1990, among Meridian Trust Company, as 
Lcssoi/Owner Trustee, Union Pacific Railroad 
Company, as Lessee, and Wilmington Tnist Company, 
as Indenture Tnistee 

Lease and Indenture Supplement No. 2, dated Dcccmbci 
27, 1990, among Meridian Trust Company, as 
Lessor/Owner Trustee, Union Pacific Railioad 
Company, as Lessee, and Wilmington Tiust Company, 
as Indenture Trustee 

Lease and Indenture Supplement No. 3, dated July 10, 
1992 

Lease and Indentuie Supplement No 4 and Amendment 
Agieement, dated October 28, 2002, among Union 
Pacific Railroad Company, as Lessee, Banc One 
Kentucky Leasing Corpoiation, as Ownei Participant, 
Wachovia Trust Company, N.A, as Owner Trustee, 
Tliiivcnt Financial foi Lutheians, as Loan Participant, 
and Wilmington Tnist Company, as Indenture Trustee 

Filing Date 

October 1, 1990 

October 1, 1990 

Recordation 
Number 

17039 

17039-A 

October 1, 1990 17039-B 

December 27, 1990 17039-C 

Not recorded. 

Not recorded 
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ORIGINAL REGISTRAR GENERAL OF CANADA FILINGS 

Description 

Lease Agieement, dated as of September 1, 1990, 
between Meridian Tiust Company, as Lessor, and Union 
Pacific Railroad Company, as Lessee 

Indenture and Security Agreement, dated as of 
September 1, 1990, between Meridian Trust Company, as 
Owner Trustee, and Wilmington Trust Company, as 
hidenture Tnistee 

Filing Date 

Octobei 1,1990 

October 1, 1990 

Document 
Key 

9752 

9753 

Lease and indentuie Supplement No. 1, dated October 1, 
1990, among Meridian Trust Company, as Lessor/Owner 
Tiustee, Union Pacific Railioad Company, as Les.see, and 
Wilmington Trust Company, as Indentuie Trustee 

Lease and Indentuie Supplement No 2, dated Decembei 
27, 1990, among Mciidian Tiust Company, as 
Lussoi/Ownei Tiustee, Union Pacific Railroad Company, 
as Lessee, and Wilmington Trust Company, as Indenture 
Tiustee 

October 1, 1990 9754 

December 27, 1990 9751 

Lease and Indenture Supplement No. 3, dated July 10, 
1992 

Notrccoided. 

Lease and Indentuie Supplement No 4 and Amendment 
Agieement, dated October 28,2002, among Union 
Pacific Railroad Company, as Lessee, Banc One 
Kentucky Leasing Coipoiation, as Owner Participant, 
Wachovia Trust Company, N.A., as Owner Tnistee, 
Thrivent Financial for Luthcinns, as Loan Participant, 
and Wilmington Trust Company, as Indenture Tiustee 

Not recorded. 
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CERTIFICATION 

I, Robert W, Alvord, attorney licensed to practice in the State of New York and the 
District of Columbia, do hereby certify under penalty of perjury that I have compared the 
attached copy with the original thereof and have found the copy to be complete and 
identical in all respects to the original document. 

Dated . l / / ^ ( < 3 g i 
Robert W. Alvord 


